
-/::'{.\:. 	 '""_:..--'="~-..::.._ .~ :--­

1/,.,07: ,.$~\~GOVERNMENT OF MEGHALAYA 
TRANSPORT ::DEPARTMENT ·:~'- \-~

if[ L7 JAN F!5 .. 
NOTIFICATION '~,o*\ ··"· /~'. 

Dated Shtllong, th \~, anuary. 20 5_,;'7::, 
~ c· . 

NO.TI'T.40//97/Pt/360- In exercise of the powers conferred by section 138 read wi~~cli<l'lr'{I)
-...':-:-__ ~.;o=---

of section 212 of the Motor Vehicle Act, 1988 (Central Act No. 59 of 1988) the Government of 

Meghalaya is pleased to make the following rules to amend the Meghalaya Installation, Regulation. 

Maintenance and Operation ofWeighbridge Rules, 2009, namely,­

l. Short title and commencement:- (I) These rules may be called the Meghalaya Installation 

Regulation, Maintenance and Operation ofWeighbridge (Amendment) Rules, 2015. 

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Otlicial Gazette. 

2.Amendmentofrule10:- (I) In rule 10 of the Meghalaya Installation Regulation. 

Maintenance and Operation of Weighbridge Rules, 2009, in sub-rule ( 1 ), in clause (b) ­

(a) 	 in sub - sub-clause (i), for the words and figures "Rs. 20" appearing therein, the 

words and figures "Rs. '100', shall be substituted; 

(b) 	 in sub- sub-clause (ii), for the words and figures "Rs. 30" appearing therein. the 

words and figures "Rs. '150', shall be substituted: 

(c) 	 in sub - sub-clause (iii), for the words and figures "Rs. 50" appearing therein, 

the words and figures "Rs. '200', shall be substituted: 

Sd/- Y. Tsering 
Additional Chief Secretary to the Govt. of Meghalaya, 

Transport Department. 
tvlcmo. NO.TPT.40/i97/Pt/360-A, Dated Shillung, the 201

h January 2015 


	Page 1

